Srver Backs Countyy Joont Mhnissgiad Autlonity

CONTRACT NO. C-471: FURNISH AND SUPPLY CHEMICALS FOR LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY’S
WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS, LEVITTOWN, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

BID DATE: AUGUST 8, 2024

Bids will be reviewed and presented Carbon Activated Corp JCI Chemical Shannon Chemical Corp George S. Coyne Chem Univar USA, Inc. Kuehne Chemical Co Arc Purification LLC Jacobi Carbon USALCO Calgon Carbon
to the Board of Direc?ors 2250 S Central Ave 103 River Street 311 Commerce Drive 3015 State Road 532 E. Emaus Street 86 N. Hackensack Ave 8051 E Maplewood Ave 201 Timberyoke Dr 3830 Bay Dr 300 GSK Drive
' Compton, CA 90220 Warwick, NY 10990 Exton, PA 19341 Croydon, PA 19021 Middletown, PA 17057 Kearny, NJ 07032 Greenwood Village, CO Moon Twp, PA Middle River, MD Moon Twp, PA
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER
ITEM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PER GALLON PER GALLON GALLONOR GALLONOR GALLONOR GALLONOR GALLONOR GALLONOR GALLONOR GALLON OR
NO. CHEMICAL NAME PER CWT OR POUND PER CWT OR POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND PER CWT POUND
DELIVERED BELNERED DELIVERED SELVERED DELIVERED BELVERED DELIVERED SELIVERED DELIVERED SELVERED DELIVERED BELIVERED DELIVERED SELVERED DELIVERED BELINVERED DELIVERED BELINVERED DELIVERED SELVERED
L | gaaNE S TON Nobid | Nobid | $91.20 | $0.912 | Nobid | Nobid No bid Nobid | $108.00 | $1.08 | $11485 | $1.1485 | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid | Nobid
2. ZINC POLYPHOSPHATE No bid No bid No bid No bid $158.17 $1.5817 $164.3413 $1.6434 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
$0.3892 $0.36/wet Ib
3. FLUOROSILICIC ACID No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $38.92 Density = $36.00 Density = No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.07 Ibs/gal 10 Ibs/gal
4 POTASSIUM No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $257.2675 $2.5727 $296.00 $2.96 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
. PERMANGANATE 0 0 0 0 0 0 . . . . ) 0 0 ) 0 0 0 0 0 0
POWDERED ey | wPH:sL37
5. $1.10/1b No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $156.00 $1.56 No bid No bid No bid No bid WPH1000: | WPH1000:
ACTIVATED CARBON $187.00 $1.87
6. HYDRATED LIME No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
HYDRATED LIME
7. (50LB BAGS) No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $33.88 $0.3388 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

All bidders submitted a 10% Bid Bond.




