Srver Backs Countyy Joont Mhnissgiad Authonity

CONTRACT NO. C-471: FURNISH AND SUPPLY CHEMICALS FOR LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY’S
WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS, LEVITTOWN, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA
BID DATE: JUNE 25, 2024

Carbon Activated Corp
2250 S Central Ave
Compton, CA 90220

JCI Chemical
103 River Street
Warwick, NY 10990

Shannon Chemical Corp
311 Commerce Drive
Exton, PA 19341

George S. Coyne Chemical
3015 State Road
Croydon, PA 19021

Univar USA, Inc.
532 E. Emaus Street
Middletown, PA 17057

Kuehne Chemical Co
86 N. Hackensack Ave
Kearny, NJ 07032

Arc Purification LLC
8051 E Maplewood Ave
Greenwood Village, CO

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE
ITEM UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE
PER GALLON PER GALLON PER GALLON GALLON OR PER GALLON
NO. CHEMICAL NAME PER CWT GALLON OR PER CWT PER CWT PER CWT PER CWT PER CWT GALLON OR PER CWT
OR POUND OR POUND OR POUND POUND OR POUND
DELIVERED POUND DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED POUND DELIVERED
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
CHLORINE — TON $96.25/ | $0.9625/ $109.80/ $115.00/ | $1.15/
L | CONTAINER NOBID | NOBID cWT B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CWT $1.098/ LB CWT B NOBID | NOBID
2. | ZINC POLYPHOSPHATE | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID $184.77/ | $1.8477/ | 3164.4481 | $1.6445/ NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
CWT LB | CWT LB
. $3.9192 $0.36/1b
$39.34/ $0.3934 | $38.92/ _ $36.00/ :
3. | FLUOROSILICICACID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID cWT Density = 10 CWT Density = CWT Density=10 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
Ibs/gal 10.07 Ibs/gal Ibs/gal
POTASSIUM $257.2675/ | $2.5727/ | $471.00
4 | CERMANGANATE NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID CWT B CWT $4.71/LB| NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
POWDERED $1.00 $97.50/ | $0.975/
5. | ACTIVATED CARBON B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID g B
6. | HYDRATED LIME NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
7. ggﬁ;g;gg)uw NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.88 | $.3388/LB | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID

All bidders submitted at 10% Bid Bond
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