
Lower Bucks County Joint Municipal Authority 
 

CONTRACT NO. C-367: FURNISH AND SUPPLY CHEMICALS FOR LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY’S  

WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS, LEVITTOWN, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA 

BID DATE: MARCH 17, 2016 
 

All chemicals were awarded in May, 2016 

with contract expirations in April, 2018 

Greer Lime Co 

598 Canyon Road 

Morgantown, WV 26508 

JCI Chemical 

103 River Street 

Warwick, NY 10990 

Shannon Chemical Corp 

311 Commerce Drive 

Exton, PA 19341 

George S. Coyne Chemical 

3015 State Road 

Croydon, PA 19021 

Univar USA, Inc. 

532 E. Emaus Street 

Middletown, PA 17057 

Kuehne Chemical Co 

86 N. Hackensack Ave 

Kearny, NJ 07032 

ITEM 

NO. 

 

CHEMICAL NAME  

UNIT PRICE 

PER CWT 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER GALLON 

OR POUND 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER CWT 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER GALLON 

OR POUND 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER CWT 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER GALLON 

OR POUND 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER CWT 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER GALLON 

OR POUND 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER CWT 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER GALLON 

OR POUND 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER CWT 

DELIVERED 

UNIT PRICE 

PER GALLON 

OR POUND 

DELIVERED 

1. CHLORINE – TON CONTAINER No Bid $20.00 $0.20 No Bid No Bid $26.95 $.2695 $30.00 $0.30 

2. 
SODIUM POTASSIUM ZINC 

POLYPHOSPHATE 
No Bid No Bid $117.00 $117,000 $129.84 $1.2984 $117.00 $1.17 No Bid 

3. FLUOROSILICIC ACID No Bid No Bid $34.34 
$34,340           

/gal Density= 

10.0  lbs/gal 

$36.79 
$.3679                

/gal Density= 

10.10 lbs/gal 

$35.50 
$ .355               

/gal Density= 

10   lbs/gal 

No Bid 

4. 
POTASSIUM 

PERMANGANATE 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $183.71 $1.8371 $320.50 $3.205 No Bid 

5. 

LIME SLURRY TREATMENT 

CHEMICAL-CALGON BLR-3715 

OR CES LIME-D-SCALE 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $212.96 

$2.1296                

/gal Density= 

8.43 lbs/gal 

No Bid No Bid 

6. 
POWDERED ACTIVATED 

CARBON 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $0.60 No Bid 

7. HYDRATED LIME $9.90 $0.0990 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8. 
HYDRATED LIME (50LB 

BAGS) 
$14.40 $0.1440 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 


