

Lower Bucks County Joint Municipal Authority

Contract WWTP-365

Restoration of Concrete Sidewalks, Driveways, Aprons, Curbs and Sites affected by Water Main Breaks

			Penn Valley Concrete & Landscape 1257 Bristol Pike Morrisville, PA 19067	AV Construction 12 Verduci Drive Newtown, PA 18940	CLC Contractors 8595 Old Rt 13 Tullytown, Pa 19007	Circle 3, LLC 128 Jackson Rd Medford, NJ 08055	JFCC 18 Steel Rd W Morrisville, PA 19067
Item No.	Unit	Description	Unit Bid Amount	Unit Bid Amount	Unit Bid Amount	Unit Bid Amount	Unit Bid Amount
1	ft ²	Saw cut as required, furnish and install 4" concrete for all required walking surfaces and restore the site as specified in these contract documents.	No bid	\$9.50	No bid	No bid	\$7.30
2	ft ²	Saw cut as required, furnish and install 6" concrete for all required drivable surfaces and restore the site as specified in these contract documents.		\$10.00			\$8.30
Total Bid Price for Base Bid / ft²				\$19.50			\$15.60

ALTERNATE BID ITEMS

3	Linear ft	Saw cut as required, furnish and install concrete curb and restore the site as specified in these contract documents.	No bid	\$35.00	No bid	No bid	\$18.00
4	ft ²	Saw cut as required, furnish and install concrete handicap ramp with cast in place truncated dome grid surface and restore the site as specified in these contract documents.		\$11.00			\$26.30
5	ft ²	Saw cut as required, furnish and install concrete handicap ramp without cast in place truncated dome grid surface and restore the site as specified in these contract documents.		\$10.00			\$7.30
6	ft ²	Saw cut as required, reconstruct bituminous concrete driveway, remove existing damaged bituminous concrete as required or as directed by Owner, stabilize sub base, install 2A modified stone, install 2" ID-2 Binder and 1 1/2" ID-2 Wearing Course including joint seal cleaning and disposal of material as specified in these contract documents.		\$5.25			\$9.75
Total of alternate bid items				\$61.25			\$61.35
Type of bid security (cc=cashiers ck / bb=bid bond)				cc			bb