

**LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY**

**CONTRACT NO. WWTP-361**

**FURNISH AND SUPPLY POLYMERS FOR LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY'S  
WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA**

**Bid Date: July 14, 2015**

<b>Contractor Name, Address, Phone &amp; Fax Number, &amp; Contact Name</b>	<b>BID AMOUNT</b>			
	<b>Emulsion Grade Polymer for Centrifuge Sludge Dewatering</b>	<b>Dry Polymer for Sludge Thickening Using Dissolved Air Flotation</b>	<b>Liquid Polymers for Flocculation of Biological Floccs</b>	<b>Dry Polymers for Filter Press Dewatering of WTP Sludge</b>
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021-6997 Ph: 215-785-3000 Fax: 215-785-1585	\$1.0944/lb \$9.488/gal \$109.44/CWT	\$1.7137/lb \$171.37/CWT	\$1.0944/lb \$9.488/gal \$109.44/CWT	\$1.6735/lb \$167.35/CWT
Polydyne Inc. One Chemical Plant Road Riceboro, GA 31323 Ph: 800-848-7659 Fax: 912-880-2078	\$1.010/lb \$8.686/gal \$101.00/CWT	\$1.550/lb \$155.00/CWT	\$0.990/lb \$8.514/gal \$99.00/CWT	\$1.50/lb \$150.00/CWT
Kemira Water Solutions 4321 W. 6 <sup>th</sup> Street Lawrence, KS 66048	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid